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To: Sudi Mungkasi <sudi@usd.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam

Received the publication fee. Within 3 days time period, paper will be
formatted as per our journal format and you will get the email from our
editing Department for the same. Thanks for your prompt response.

On Fri, Apr 19, 2019 at 6:17 AM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
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Received the payment made evidence. Normally all foreign transaction
will take 3 to 5 days time period to credit the money into our account.
After receiving the money, paper will be published in online. We will
inform the status of the paper
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account that you mentioned for the publication of Paper ID: IJMET/10/04/2019/IJMET_43102.
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Phone: +62 274 883037 ext. 52335; Fax: +62 274 886529
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Subject: Paper Acceptance Notification IJMET/10/04/2019/IJMET_43102
 
Dear Gendon Barus and Sudi Mungkasi
 
We would like to inform you that your paper titled “On the publication of
research papers in the area of character education” has been accepted
for publication in International Journal of Mechanical Engineering and
Technology (IJMET), Volume 10, Issue 04, (April 2019) issue of the
journal based on the Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any
major corrections in the content submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.
 
Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons
Attribution 4.0 (International) License (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no
need to submit the Copyright form.
 
Your research paper will be appearing in IJMET, Volume 10, Issue 04, April
2019.
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mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more than 20
search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

 
You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made
evidence through e-mail.
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Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest.
 
Thank & Regards.

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
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