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ICBS Universitas Gadjah Mada,
Indonesia <icbs-biougm@ugm.ac.id>
Tue 1/11/2022 9:20 AM

To: Yustina Sri Hartini
<yustinahartini@usd.ac.id>;Dewi
Setyaningsih <dewi@usd.ac.id>;Icbs Bio
Ugm <icbs-biougm@ugm.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Yustina Sri Hartini,
Congratulations!


It is our pleasure to inform you that your
paper #51-094 entitled "The Potency of
Red Betel Methanolic Extract as α-
Amylase and α-Glucosidase Inhibitor" has
been ACCEPTED for the ICBS 2021
Proceeding (https://www.atlantis-
press.com/proceedings/series/absr).


Upon receiving this confirmation email,
please proceed by fulfilling the payment
as stated in the following
link: http://ugm.id/ICBSpayment.


Here we attach the final version of your
manuscript. If you have any corrections,
please provide highlights and/or
comments in the attached file. If you have
no corrections, please upload the final
version of your manuscript (the attached
PDF file) as it is in the ePaper.


Thank you very much for contributing to
the ICBS 2021 Proceeding. For any
inquiries, please contact us at email:icbs-
biougm@ugm.ac.id.


Kind regards,

The Conference Chairs
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