
Fwd: [JPMIPA] Editor Decision

Dari: Patricia agrivina (patrisiaangrivina@gmail.com)

Kepada: hongkijulie@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Jumat, 15 Desember 2023 pukul 10.33 WIB

---------- Forwarded message ---------
Dari: jpmipa unila <jpmipa@fkip.unila.ac.id>
Date: Sel, 24 Okt 2023 pukul 05.53
Subject: [JPMIPA] Editor Decision
To: Agri Patricia Agrivina Dyastika <patrisiaangrivina@gmail.com>

Agri Patricia Agrivina Dyastika:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Jurnal Pendidikan MIPA, "PCK Profile of Mathematics
Education Students in Practicing the Flipped Classroom Strategy".

Our decision is to: Revision Required

Please find a file containing reviewers' comments on your journal account and send your revision back to
us no later than 31 October 2023.  You must revise the manuscript for every single reviewer's comments. If
the revised manuscript file has not been uploaded to OJS according to the deadline, we will automa�cally
reject the manuscript.

We will double check your revision and the decision to accept or not depends on the results of
your revision. The reference issues should be fixed as requested by the editor.

We are looking forward to seeing your revision. Thank you.  Best Regards

Note: Please reply to this mail to ensure that you have received this email.
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Fwd: [JPMIPA] Article Accepted

Dari: Patricia agrivina (patrisiaangrivina@gmail.com)

Kepada: hongkijulie@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Jumat, 15 Desember 2023 pukul 10.34 WIB

---------- Forwarded message ---------
Dari: jpmipa unila <jpmipa@fkip.unila.ac.id>
Date: Min, 29 Okt 2023 pukul 13.06
Subject: [JPMIPA] Article Accepted
To: Agri Patricia Agrivina Dyastika <patrisiaangrivina@gmail.com>, <hongkijulie@yahoo.co.id>

Patricia & Co-Author:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Jurnal Pendidikan MIPA.

Our decision is to: Article Accepted

Your article will be sent to the Layout Editor to be scheduled for Publication in 2023. For completing this
publication, you are requested to pay the Publication Cost that is transferred into:

Recipient             : Andrian Saputra
Name of Bank     : BNI
Account Number: 0691067751
Total Amount      : 1,000,000

Please let me know if your payment has been completed by sending the proof of payment via
this email. Payment deadline is 30 October 2023. If there are things you want to ask, please do not hesitate to
contact me. We are looking forward to publishing your article. Thank you. Best Regards
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